10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

A3) @ 1 G
“(iii) Services by way of admission to amusement parks including theme parks, water
parks, joy rides, merry-go rounds, go-carting and ballet.

9 -

(iiia) Services by way of admission to entertainment events or access to amusement
facilities including exhibition of cinematograph films, casinos, race club, any 14 -7
sporting event such as Indian Premier League and the like.

(B) initem (vi), after the brackets and figures “(iii)”, the brackets and figures “(iiia),” shall be inserted;
(ii) for paragraph 2, the following shall be substituted, namely: -

“2. In case of supply of service specified in column (3), in item (i); sub-item (b), sub-item (c), sub-item (d), sub-item
(da) and sub-item (db) of item (iv); sub-item (b), sub-item (c), sub-item (d) and sub-item (da) of item (v); and sub-item
(c) of item (vi), against serial number 3 of the Table above, involving transfer of land or undivided share of land, as the
case may be, the value of such supply shall be equivalent to the total amount charged for such supply less the value of
transfer of land or undivided share of land, as the case may be, and the value of such transfer of land or undivided
share of land, as the case may be, in such supply shall be deemed to be one third of the total amount charged for such
supply.
Explanation. —For the purposes of this paragraph, “total amount” means the sum total of,-
(a) consideration charged for aforesaid service; and

(b) amount charged for transfer of land or undivided share of land, as the case may be including by way of lease or
sublease.”.

[F. No.354/13/2018-TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

Note:— The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 11/2017 -
Central Tax(Rate), dated the 28"June, 2017, vide number G.S.R. 690 (E), dated the 28" June, 2017 and was last
amended by notification No. 46/2017-Central Tax (Rate), dated the 140 November, 2017 vide number G.S.R.
1405(E), dated the14™ November, 2017.

FrfrEeT
7% faeett, 25 s9asT, 2018

|, 2/2018- FH T (V)

qr. &1, 65(3).—F=17 7T U FarwT dfafaaa, 2017 (2017 &1 12) &t g 11 67 ST &= (1) F d8d
ST AT FT TART FXd U, e T3 30 910 ° QS 21d gU (% UHAT FIAT S ad § Aaeda g T Tug 6
farTiert & Seme Uw, UAg g, 9d aar, foeq #eres (s o) i st e 12/201 7550 77
(%), Taeier 28 S, 2017 fS5ra ar.ar.fA. 691 (31) faATH 28 S, 2017 F T WILT & TSI, AHTLTI F AR, TS
3, 3U-we (i) ® weriora o war o, ® i s oft et e wedt 8, 797 -
I ATEAAT H, AR H -
(F) wH "EeAT 3 F gH Fwad (3) K wfaf® #, avErdy wiewry” aqsdi F eArq ‘A "t AEr” ersat wr
st faRaT ST, -
(@) FH HEaT 3 T 399 Hatad gAtsAt F vearq Mt w7 e o wfategy fiv siqefua G s,
T~




[9FT 1I-ETE 3(i)]

AR <pT TSTAA ¢ SHTERIT

11

(1)

()

3)

“3%

qEATT 99

GfFu F saeue 2437 % davia fR deTEa @ oar
HiagT™ % ageas 2439 F siavq Rl F¥ A & =i
o Y #w F gefaa frdr Gramsen F Arerw ¥ F

AL, ToF FLRTT T e 1T & AT T ITH0r a1
LRI TIFEOT 97 At [Fapra &7 < ST arelt wier ue
Farelt i HFT g e AT At IFq GqFT A AT
oo Ut g & o | 25 wiaera & sifew 7 87 |

I,

()

FH GEAT 16 F THe, Hraw (3) f vt &, “UF a0 ot F vara qv fT a9 aeat w giaertua T

SITUATT,

FH TEAT 19 ¥ 39 "atea ATt & Teanq Meatatad 7 Ser T giafedy #iv sia.earaq f&Far s,

79T -

(1) (2) 3) (4) (5)

“19% | o 9965 | 9T ¥ fRua et Feerw Feiioid woM | =@ | T WA § fAfga g ff 319 30
¥ qed & arge foua Tt s o fRrawae, 2018 ¥ aT7 @ ASF 20 |
FTLATT F FIT ATA F TagT T %
ATEAH F <F ST ATl 4T

197 | ofr§ 9965 | WTEa § fRuq Tt Fwerq woiiavy wom | 977 | 39 whaAfe & fAfga &g «ff s 30
¥ aeg F arge Rug G vamm ™ faawae, 2018 F 12 @0 A51 g1 |
ST F FIT AT & IREET F3d &
ATEAH F <F ST ATl 4T

(®)

FH AT 22 F 984, Fwed (3) i ¥ATE #, 97 (7@) F veArq, AeAterfaa 7z # siq e G s, 7 -
“(m) v Rt =t v Rt srearuet i wHETRET F atag & foro wiew arga S 5 v Srerfore "eer

farmrmfofa, sreamoht SfiY FH=THAT & wivag i qar ware Far gr s {6 fermers 7d fF frar s areafas wqe an
WL T 0 (AT F ATEAH & FAT HAT0 TG FT 857

() FH HEAT 29 F qwe =T 399 deted wfafy % geurq Mfefaa ww e siw wafsat v siawntia G
STTUSTT, 72T -
(1) () (3) (4) (5)
g% | offf 9971 | Fv% TIHT FHI ATHEH AT AT & siqid qeeed® & | IF o=;
ar ofyg | PAEITCAT T AAT T TOATEA HE F WILTH H T hi S
9991 Tt 71 Y= R S ¥ o gy & wE Sfam i E
(%) &9 @ear 36 & gHe, How (3) i qAf® #, wg (1) F “U=w0g AT Oeai F €A UL “FN AT A5l Al

gfaeenfua far s,

FH TEAT 36 Y I HEtad TEATSAT & TeATq Meafatad 7 SeT T qafedy wiv sia.earaq f&#ar s,

T -



12 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

(1) (2) 3) (4) (5)
“36% | oftf 9971 ar | FH HEAT 35 AT 36 H Mt AT TSt F I I o
o 9991 FAAT F AT | & T ATAT HATE

(A)  FH geAT 39 37 I9H Hataq giatedt & ge=rq, Mwfofag w7 @ i sfateat wiv wiaetoa B s,
7T -
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)
“39% | ofrf 9971 | ot &g oam avar fadrw snfdw se & Rua A Jamet % areea | =7 =T
ST Fevaere wreatoge afdfes dex (rEuwuaE) w2 g, F
BT 9 % arege Rua fft aregs #ir siawredy et et &
forT sreeiar = & e Fret arer g & <) 1€ Fere
TR - T TR % 3297 ¥ forw, smduwuasr § et daet
& HTEAE F ST UH =017 7 3,
(i) o8 e avwT 7 =9 [fvea aqata a1 wrear & g a1
e i 7 =v At squfy & 2 a1 S adowuash &
At & foro e &S At & % =0 § aregar &1 €, =7
(ii) o8 FAesht qar wegw (s et & wex) A,
2015 % A AT o ATZT HT s (FAE =A< 9T 797 81, 37
(i) ST 3wt frmr BfEmE ve G st (saeasa
el ar =) ¥ Ron-f¥er, 2015 F sfasiq sweUwUEET ST
atersrdy % =9 | vsfiga g1, ar
(iii) o st gfaqfa v AfFw aE, (@@ F adm st
g fafama e (slawasd, A e #eg) fRreom-fAder, 2015 %

Savtq =9 Ated saAta ya™ f 21 |

(31) %W HEAT 45 F THe, Fiaw (3) i yf=Ate 7,

i. HE (F), 3T A (i) F TeATq, Ao 3T A F s AT AT STos, 79T-

“(iii) v TERTL, TST ALY, T ST &, TITATT FTIAFHLOT, ALRTET ATIAFHL0T AT qEar<t =ahr;”;

i, g (@), 37 WL (i) F 7oA, FMeAterEa 37 7 i s efud G s, 76w

“(iv) Fvg TEHRTT, TST TERTT, T TST &7, TATA I TTFEHT0T, FLRTET STEHT0T AT FEhTeT =TT,
iii. WF (M), 3T 7L (i) F veATq, FeAforiET 3T A F s EAvUd AT S, 7T

“(iii) g TLRTT, TST TLHTL, T ST &, T TTIARTT, LT ITIRFT0r A7 qeanr<y foanr 17

() | e 53 30T 3aw "atad wfafeat ¥ vearq Aeafafa ww d@er s vty @i saerfia B s,

T -

(1) () ) (4) (5)

“53% | off 9985 | FIT ITATET & AT | AT & WILAH § & ST ATl HaTd T | o,




[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] HRA hT SIS : STHIEROI 13

(3) FW °EAT 54 F 984, Fad (3) i GAE ¥ 72 (), F TeAq Mt 98 #i siaearfug e s, 769w-

“(ST) T SUTET F TALETSHI | gHF F HIEAT F <F ST qTeAl qaTw |”
() W AT 60 F THeA, Fiaw (3) it AP § sz “Frer warery,” & fAefaa fram sromm, o
() | HEAT 65 30T 3HH "ated wfafeat ¥ wearq Aeafafa ww d@er s wafsat @i sa:earfia B s,

7T -

(1 2) (3) 4) ()

“65% | o7 9991 | F=AT FT aAfarwe arfarfazw, 2005 (2005 &1 22) F siavia LT | =
ST T&TH e % HTeqw F &1 S+ reft Hard

(Y1)  FW HEAT 66 F THA, Few (3) it yfAT® F -
i. WE(F) F Te=ATq, AEtortaa 78wt staerfud B srosm, 7om-
‘(o) ToReT QreAforen HEAT ZTRT YA o F ®T H Awe & Uas § YA THAT F AT F:h & T
ATt FAT;”
ii. ¥ @) H,-

(F) IT-9% (iv) |, “ ATEATHE T q6” Tal I (AL a7 ST,

(@) 379 (iv), % Tearq, Feaferfaa 3o ag & siaeanfog B s, 7om-
“(v) TSTHIA STeed IT TS dhed & ot ared g

() u=q ®, oTex, Fcoah AT AT “THATS (@)’ F €I I 9158, FITsH A¥ FT “HS (F) * 3T 97 (i), (ii)
A (jii) ” 1 wfeerioq BT s,

(%) ae=qF & weaTq Meferfad wege v siq et o, F9m-
“gord oY fF B3 7= (@) F 37 7% (v) § Wi wre oft arq UE dearet 9w 9n) 98t gri S, -
(i) ferermers & foreT e S==ra¥ Areatie T¥ a% AT THHS T qh (9027 F |reaq 9, 47
(i) et STt =ameaTias freT qrewa & UF fRe0 & w7 § a7 % Areqw ¥ o971 Far 7
U
(A) F "=AT 77 F G0, Fiaw (3) F v&ATS |, 7% (1) H 97 FAT 9511 F T T G gL T+ |l 95T HY
gfareatoa e s, 79m:-
(F) w9 FEAr 81 F g0, wiaw (3) it wfAf® F v = fMw=ferfea gfafe #r yheantia fBem srom, gom-
“Freaforfaa & waar % afaeme F =9 § & S aret Far -

() T, T AT Frue-A=e s qaresh a7 5o | ot g;
(&) TERTE THTUE, Sa HRg A Ifore staarfar, afa ssoie ar #rs frer S & wrear g fer
quTIEg ¥ 9T g,




14 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

(3T) HT=IET T SHIST THTE;
(%) AR,
STET ITAFT 0T (F), (@), (1) IT (F) § 797 AT THTIG JT TITA0 H T 5 AT 7 Ffawer 500 FI7 sf
SR T AAF TG |
[T, %.354/13/2018 -&rame]

=t foee, saw afee

qE :— T ATSFEAT AT 12/2017-F17 T (IX), faA1® 28 57, 2017 #r ar.a1.4 691 (31), faaiw 28 4,
2017 & qgad AT & TSI, AATLTION, o TT-11, ©e-3, IT-TT (i) H Rt fhar o o7 & zow sifaw
T ATAGAAT HEAT 47/2017-F517 FT (37) 3w 14 Fawaw, 2017 GF aranf™ 1406 (31)
14 TaFg, 2017 F qgd WLd % TSI, STETETN, F AW- 1, Ge-3, IT-6 (i) § i o 73w o, &
FTT Ty foRar AT 2 |

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 2/2018- Central Tax (Rate)

G.S.R. 65(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 11 of the Central Goods and
Services Tax Act, 2017 (12 of 2017), the Central Government, on being satisfied that it is necessary in the public interest
so to do, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby makes the following further amendments in the notification of
the Government of India, in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue), No.12/2017- Central Tax (Rate), dated
the 28"June, 2017, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), vide number
G.S.R. 691(E), dated the 28th June, 2017, namely:-

In the said notification, in the Table, -

(a) against serial number 3, in the entry in column (3), after the words “a Governmental Authority” the words “
or a Government Entity” shall be inserted;

(b) after serial number 3 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be

inserted, namely: -

D @ 3) @ 5)
“3A Chapter 99 | Composite supply of goods and services in which the value of | Nil Nil”;
supply of goods constitutes not more than 25 per cent. of the
value of the said composite supply provided to the Central
Government, State Government or Union territory or local
authority or a Governmental authority or a Government Entity
by way of any activity in relation to any function entrusted to a
Panchayat under article 243G of the Constitution or in relation
to any function entrusted to a Municipality under article 243W
of the Constitution.

(c) against serial number 16, in the entry in column (3), for the words “one year”, the words “three years” shall
be substituted;



[9FT 1I-ETE 3(i)]

AR <pT TSTAA ¢ SHTERIT

15

(d) after serial number 19 and the entries relating thereto, the following
inserted, namely: -

serial number and entries shall be

0 @ 3) @) 8)

“19A Heading 9965 | Services by way of transportation | Nil Nothing contained in this serial
of goods by an aircraft from number shall apply after the
customs station of clearance in 30" day of September, 2018.
India to a place outside India.

19B Heading 9965 | Services by way of transportation | Nil Nothing contained in this serial
of goods by a vessel from customs number shall apply after the
station of clearance in India to a 30" day of September, 2018.7;
place outside India.

(e) against serial number 22, in the entry in column (3), after item (b), the following item shall be inserted,
namely: -

“(c) motor vehicle for transport of students, faculty and staff, to a person providing services of

transportation of students, faculty and staff to an educational institution providing services by way of pre-
school education and education upto higher secondary school or equivalent.”;

(f) after serial number 29 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -
) ) 3) 4) ®)
“29A | Heading Services of life insurance provided or agreed to be provided by | Nil Nil”;
9971 ) or | the Naval Group Insurance Fund to the personnel of Coast Guard
I;;;?mg under the Group Insurance Schemes of the Central Government.
(g) against serial number 36, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “fifty thousand”, the words
“two lakhs” shall be substituted;
(h) after serial number 36 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -
ey (©)) 3 ) )
“36A Heading | Services by way of reinsurance of the insurance schemes | Nil Nil”;
9971 or | specified in serial number 35 or 36.
Heading
9991

(i) after serial number 39 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be

inserted, namely: -

Centre (IFSC) status to a customer located outside India for
international financial services in currencies other than
Indian rupees (INR).

Explanation.- For the purposes of this entry, the intermediary
of financial services in IFSC is a person,-

(i) who is permitted or recognised as such by the Government
of India or any Regulator appointed for regulation of IFSC;
or

(ii) who is treated as a person resident outside India under the
Foreign Exchange Management (International Financial
Services Centre) Regulations, 2015; or

(iii) who is registered under the Insurance Regulatory and

(1) ) (3) “) &)
“39A Heading Services by an intermediary of financial services located in a | Nil Nil”;
9971 multi services SEZ with International Financial Services




16 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

Development Authority of India (International Financial
Service Centre) Guidelines, 2015 as IFSC Insurance Office;
or

(iv) who is permitted as such by Securities and Exchange
Board of India (SEBI) under the Securities and Exchange
Board of India (International Financial Services Centres)
Guidelines, 2015.

(j) against serial number 45, in the entry in column (3).-
iv. initem (a), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or
Government Entity;”;

v. initem (b), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(iv) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or
Government Entity;”;

vi. initem (c), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or
Government Entity.”;

(k) after serial number 53 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -

€)) @) (€) “ (&)
“53A | Heading 9985 Services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of | Nil Nil”;
agricultural produce.

(1) against serial number 54, in the entry in column (3), after item (g), the following item shall be inserted,
namely:-

“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce.”;

(m) against serial number 60, in the entry in column (3), the words “the Ministry of External Affairs,” shall be
omitted;

(n) after serial number 65 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -

€9) ) 3 “@ Q)
“65A | Heading 9991 Services by way of providing information under the Right | Nil Nil”;
to Information Act, 2005 (22 of 2005).

(o) against serial number 66, in the entry in column (3),-
i.  after item (a), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(aa) by an educational institution by way of conduct of entrance examination against consideration in the
form of entrance fee;”;

ii. initem (b),-
A. in sub-item (iv), the words “upto higher secondary” shall be omitted;

B. after sub-item (iv), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(v) supply of online educational journals or periodicals:”;

C. in the proviso, for the word, brackets and letter “entry (b)”, the words, brackets and letters “sub-items (i),
(ii) and (iii) of item (b)” shall be substituted;

D. after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-



[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] HRA hT SIS : STHIEROI 17

“Provided further that nothing contained in sub-item (v) of item (b) shall apply to an institution providing
services by way of,-

() pre-school education and education up to higher secondary school or equivalent; or

(ii) education as a part of an approved vocational education course.”;

(p) against serial number 77, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “five thousand”, the words
“seven thousand five hundred” shall be substituted;

(q) against serial number 81, for the entry in column (3), the following entry shall be substituted, namely: -
“Services by way of right to admission to-
(a) circus, dance, or theatrical performance including drama or ballet;

(b) award function, concert, pageant, musical performance or any sporting event other than a recognised
sporting event;

(c) recognised sporting event;
(d) planetarium,

where the consideration for right to admission to the events or places as referred to in items (a), (b), (c) or (d)
above is not more than Rs 500 per person.”.

[F. No.354/13/2018 -TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

Note:—  The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 12/2017

- Central Tax (Rate), dated the ZSthune, 2017, vide number G.S.R. 691 (E), dated the ZSthune, 2017 and was
last amended by notification No.47/2017 - Central Tax (Rate), dated the 14% November, 2017 vide number
G.S.R. 1406(E), dated the 140 November, 2017.

i@
% fawett, 25 s=adt, 2018

. 3/2018-FH=1 FX ()

... 66 (31).—Fw=1= AT T FaTRe AfAfAEw, 2017 (2017 & 12) F¥ o121 09 & 37 41T (3) F dgd

waed ofxrdl T WART F3d g0, Feg Gy, T i Aerfen F sream a2, vaegnr, wwa aeEr, o g
(Trotea faem) it stfergEeT "ear 13/2017-F07 #¥ (37), faai® 28 57, 2017 S| arar.fA. 692 (3r) fa=i+ 28 9,
2017 % qgd W o TSI, SIETLT0T % A- 11, @< 3, I9-8< (i) § wehrfera foam v o, § o s oft fReferfea
T FAT g, TAT -

3% Aferg=aT ¥, -

(@i

qreeft §, F9 ey 5 e 3ew "ot wfafeat & vearq, Mfafag w0 der v saq @afaq sfafest

st eTiaa AT ST, -

(1)

(2) 3) (4)

“5%

FeT WIS TS 4T H AT, 2017 (2017 7 | Frg TR, ST | Fesld A U HaT FT AAAT,
12) ¥ faviq ustiga Bt =afRF #1 o= gufy #1 | 99, 99 T | 2017 F dqud geigd i off
BT 97 3T ey G, ST G, T T o | HA AT T | AT |

a7 weTefier SFReRoT 3 e & S ATt | STt




